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JOHN LOSCHIN ''<]ilii:;:;:::::: ::11111::::::: :· 
<::::::::::::::::::::::::::::::· 

~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~--.... 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
CC: 
BCC: 

McHugh, George 
10/27/2003 08:20:28 AM 
Loschin, John 

.::::::::::::::::::::::::::::.:·.·. 

·-:.:·:.:.:.:.:.:-: 

Subject: Istvan Berczi, DVM, PhD. Manitoba,Canada;:)\i.l.7tro@i~@:t~1'¥1.ir. RE00067527 
(resolved) .,.,.,.,.,.,.. ...,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,., ... 

John, 
David Wainman at Ilion called me Friday and told mifff:\~]\~:'l.!(f!.S finally given the release lo 

ship the repair back to Canada. If it hasn't already been shipped;·t'n(i@.f:@ihJhat it is being shipped this 
morning. 

George A McHugh 
Remington Arms co., Inc. 
International Customer Service 
Tel: 336-548-8832 
Fax: 336-548-8610 
george.mchugh@reminglon.com 

-----Orig ina I Message----­
From: Loschin, John 

./~~~~utmrnt~:~I~J~~~~~~:~~~~~~~~~~({::::::::::::::.:-: .. 
:::::::~:~~~:~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~~:~~~~~:~::::::.:-.· .. 

sent: Monday, October 27, 2003 8: 16 AM .. ,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.. 
To: McHugh, George 
Subject: RE: Istvan Berczi, DVM, PhD. "''"'""'"''-'<>. 
repair. RE00067527 

Has this been resolved? 

-----Orig ina I Message----- .::::;.,.,.. 
From: McHugh, George ){( 
Sent: Friday, October 24, 2003.JW45 P~:::;c. 
To: Nagle, Thomas J. ::::::::::::- .,::;:;:,:,: .. 
Cc: Sanita, Dennis J.; Losch!i.J/M.hn; ~~lgh. Jerry R.; Nickerson, E. Ken; Wainman. David S.; Stout. 
Robert :<::>::::::>:>::/?? 
Subject: Istvan Berczi, DVM, ·pfi'[):j::j@~#.i~~l.¥!:~9anada, M700 rifle repair. RE00067527 

.................. 
To anyone who can help m.e:"<f:t:J}:, ,.. 

I was·foid]&.foh},;iin an export license in August for Mr. Berzci's rifle 
RE00067527. Mr. Be,gtj:W@fit~~JM@~i#WBone and paid by VISA. I have since been in communication 
with Mr. Berzci and,$~·:MW@ifre'paifsince then. The export license was sent to David Wainman on 
October 10. The gui'flif~t\!l}aj~ti:r:J:Q.in shipping because it is on 'invoice hold'. Can someone release this 
so it can be shipped. . ... ,.,,,,,,,,,,,,:,:,::;:;:;:::::::,., ... 

·: ·: -: :~ :::::::::::::::::::::::::::::, 

George A Mct-JJ!:9:WI::t:: 
Remington Arro~::c-o·.·:rnc". .... ,.,.,.,.,.,,,_ 
lnternational.:bastomer Servfcif:'/. 
Tel: 336-54(iM32 
Fax: 336-54&861.0 .::::::::::::: 
george. m chugti.@.rnr;ii,_~Ql(J_n,,p§,§''' 

Subject to Protective v. Remington 
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