
BARBER· REM DOCSB0016360 

> International Customer Service 
>Tel: 336-548-8832 
> Fax: 336-548-8610 
> george.mchugh@remington.com 
> 
> 
> 
>-----Original Message-----
> From: Istvan Berczi [mailto:berczii@Ms.UManitoba.CA] 
>Sent: Monday, September 22, 2003 5:49 PM 
>To: McHugh, George 
> SutJject: Re: Istvan Berczi, DVM, PhD. ManitotJa,Canada, 
> repair. RE00067527 
> 
> 
> Dear Mr. McHugh, .::;:;::::-:-.. 
> I faxed the repair authorization form to you today. I hope~~~[~\!\::: 
>you will be able to proceed smoothly. Sincerely yours. lstva"i'i'Be~f\\ 
> Suoject: Istvan Berczi, DVM, PhD. Manitoba, Canada, M7ci"O''ri•f:W ... , ••.. ,.,., ••. , 
> repair. RE00067527 Date sent: Tue, 9 Sep 20Q~.J':l:J,9';!?:1::":MQ(f?•?F 

: ~~~~t~e.McH~~~@::~~n~~on.com> T~McHugh, Ge"~~~i~~~:~~i'..'' -:: 
.·.:.:.:.:·:.:.:.:.:.:-:.:.:.:.: ..... 

> <berczii@Ms.UManitoba.CA> 
> 
> > Dear Dr. Berczi, .-:-:-:-::•· .-:·:· .. 
> > Please send me the information again tJy en#i){or to t\hfrax 
> > 336-548-861 O. I cannot find the fax you hayiB#ferre~:W 
>> 
> > George A. McHugh 
> > Remington Arms Co .. Inc. 
> > International Customer Service 
>>Tel: 336-548-8832 
>>Fax: 336-548-8610 
> > george.mchugh@remington.com 
>> 

::::~:~:~:~:~:::~:~:~:~:~:~:: :: :: ·. 

·.:.:-:.:.:.:.:· 

: : •::•••<t_•·.•·.·.•.·.•.·.•.· ...•. •.•.•.•.•.•.•.•.•.•.:.'.'·'.: •••·:-:-:· ···:·.<·:.:.:.:.:·· 
>>-----Original Message----- /::::,:,.... ··::::::;:::::::....:::::::::::• 
> > From: Istvan Berczi [mailto:ber'(j~\~M~A,!.Manitiilia)~AJ 
> > Sent: Tuesday, September O~, .2bO~'f4,jQ~J~M::,.,. · 
>>To: McHugh, George ?? · "'•:::••••••••> 
> > Subject: Re: Istvan Berczi, OVM, PhQ ... Manifoba:;):;)anada, M700 rifle 
> > repair. RE00067527 ... :.:.:.:.:. :::}':':''' 

; ; Dear Mr McHugh ,:••••••1••••••••1:••••••••••••••••:•1••••••:••·:··· 
. ' "•:-:-:-:-:-:-:-:-:-:-:-:-::-:-:.·. 

> > I did Fax the authoriz~tipn fo.riitfu•fiiid~S:\/Veek and gave my 
> > credit card number ttj~ffitt~l~9 maii"e(ffhifpriginal form to your 
> > company at the samirt\M~;rni~il:S.fi;l. charge.the entire cost of the 
> > repair plus handling costs fo'ffif~f:®\tg:µ-d. I hope that this will 
>>be satisfactory. Sincernl.Y.:)9Uf!ii;:iffi:MWSerczi. Subject: 
> > Istvan Berqff P\i.MHl?:f:id?M~i\ifoffa.Canada. M700 rifle repair. 
> > RE00067527 Dati:~)l~f:iti:::: •. :-. Mon, 8 Sep 2003 13:10:39 -0400 From: 
> > "McHugh, Geoi"g@'.@@@m~"-McHugh@remington.com> To: 
> > "Istvan Berczi': <berczll@M~A_!Manitoba.CA> 
> > .::::::::>::>>:\:::::::. ·::•:::::;::;:--
> > > Dear Dr)~~ftdf •::: ••••••••>:. 
> > > I cc@$ded our re'pait:f:~_cility on Ilion, NY. They informed 
> > > meJ~~t they did noft@~ive the $ 20.00 fee for the 
> > > insP:MHon and servic$Jjertormed on your rifle. Did you send 
> > > this':Y:ff?::.lf not ple<;1~ffend it to: 
> > > REMINGT:bNARMS:OOHNc. 
> > > P.O .. B.OX 706{\:?::::;:::::::::··· 

:.:·:.:.:.:.:· ···.·.·.·· 

··:.:.:-:.:.:.:.:.:-:.:.:.:·.·.· .. ·.:.:.:-:.:.:.:·· 
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