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> > that they did not receive the$ 20.00 fee for the inspection 
> > and service performed on your rifle. Did you send this yet ? 
> > If not please send it to: 
> > REMINGTON ARMS CO. INC. 
>>P.O. BOX 700 
> > MADISON, NC 27025 
>>USA 
>> 
> > Please note your 'repair' number on your check and any .-:::::-.·.·. 
>>correspondence you enclose. the number is RE00067527. Althtj~ij)Ji you 
>>will pay$ 20 .. 00 , you will also be given a 'gift certificate' from/{:( 
> > Remington for$ 20.00 good for Remington merchandise only.;(Jfo~::,., 
> > program that allows this is posted on our website: www.remif:!W~~:;~i}@:\::;:,: 
> > . It is called the "Safety modification program". I copies somiif::Qf -:-:-:;::;:;::;:::;:;:::::::;:;:;:,:,., ... 
>>the text below: Here are the basic program elements: ······· 
>> k~. 
>>"The firearms will be cleaned and inspected and the boli:Jq~~t\:,, 
> > mechanism will be removed for $20.00 plus shipping and.hifflq@g:)f:\/:f!). .. 
>>will return the gun to you with a $20.00 rebate coupon good towMtt~t{/: ... ,.,.,., 
>>the purchase of any Remington brand safety producJ .. (~Y.~-:Prntw.;;~!:Q:fi~::rH:::t 
> > hearing protection, cable and trigger locks, gun caq~@~~)i:&fguii:::::::::: ·· ··· 
>>safes.)" :::::::::J\:>::::: .. 
> > ·.--:-::;::::::::::::::::::::::::::::-:·.·. 
>>The rifle cannot be shipped direct back to you. I ~~:Ye spok~M''Mt~::f:>: 
> > "Gene's Gunsmithing" in Selkirk. I have asked tj~ffi''to o~;;i,i_n the ........ . 
> > necessary Canadian papers that I must have tif~pply ff)fjii"n expqr:t. 
> > license. I do not know how much longer it vv.iI:foke rn~:fo obtain}{/ 
>>an export license. You may want to speak v).~ij]~~.n~.:§:~hningJfuH)wner 
> > of "Gene's ... " I would recommend that, in tfie:mrn~~M~:u shou:iif( 
> > contact Gene's gunsmithing for any repairs beforii'S:ijij;ii;i@'i:t:&:W 
>>firearm out of your country. Gene could hl;l.)(.!;:.R~.r.formeifa!i:~~~'same 
>>service required without the difficulties,!'!@i@#:!~W:AA!:!sed by'lhe 
> > import-export process. . ............. ,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,.,., .. 

> > :-:-:-:-:-:·· ·-:-:-:-:-:-:-:· 
> > George A. McHugh 
> > Remington Arms Co., Inc. 
> > International Customer Service 
>>Tel: 336-548-8832 
>>Fax: 336-548-8610 

~:::::::~: ... ·. '··:.:~=~:=:/(:~~~:~:}:::::=:~:. 

> > george.mchugh@remington.q_qrii '"'''':\:\:\)\::::-:· .. 
>> 
>> 
> > .... :::::::.:· .:::::'"'"'"'' 
>>-----Original Message-----:{/: .){/ 
> > From: Istvan Berczi [mai@i\m~gi.i.@Ms.UManitoba.CA] 

~ ~ ~~~~~~~;h: ~~~t~~~~r·ostw.J~r':81,~t::),~,. 
> > Subject: Re: Istvan ~,j,iifoMJWM, Phd':''MMitoba,Canada, M700 rifle 
> > repair. RE00067527 ''''''\Ht?+:::\:;:,.,. ..,., ... 
> > . ··:::;:::::::++:?:\:: .. 
> > ........ :·:·:·:·:-:·:·:-:-:-:·:·:-:-:-:·:·:·:-:-:· 
> > Dear Mr McHugtKt:::[f:t:::j:::(:::::;::::· 
> > The other day i s@(Y,Q\;IJ!.)e authorization for the repair of my 
>>gun. However, you.foii:Qfili~J~~t¥.ou actually have done the work 
> > already. I must SCIYJhet yfrifll.~~ij@this matter with the utmost care 
> > and I much Cl:P.P.@~@1~:'¥.:Q..ur efforl!f If you don't mind I would like 
> > to know w~~rn:iiE'We$f.~@:r1ow with this and that how can I get back 
> > my rifle. @ppreciate yci"u@gy_ice of dealing with your repairman in 
> > Selkirk, f:i~Wever, I tried to"':~(@act him by phone for a couple of 
>>weeks af.ij:@~ver succeed6,~/13ecause it would have taken much more 
> > effort to gtjJ~~rn and to firji$.§ut what is going on, I rather sent 
>>the gun to y@:;)i;~!R~;::Hf:~~fyou much more than I do anyone else 
>>with tb,.i~,,:;;.~nsifi%:@#fdb'"not see the problem with exporting, 

:.:·:.:.:.:.:· ···.·.·.·· 

··:.:.:-:.:.:.:.:.:-:.:.:.:·.·.· .. ·.:.:.:-:.:.:.:·· 
Subject to Protective Oi'.q~(f,Wfi!lfams v. Remington 
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