Mike Keeney

From: Morgan, Metty E.

Sent: 02/18/2005 01:08:32 PM

To: Brennan, John T.

CC: Keeney, Mike

BCC:

Subject: RE: P/N F202540 700 SS TRIGGER PIN
John

Martin from Palladin called me. Seems that you and | do n
He has both drawings and says they are different.

? He said your pin does NOT have

a head on it.

Must be my mistake. | thought the M710 and M700 useg:t

he same trigger pivot pin.

Sorry bout that.

Metty E. Morgan
Purchasing
REMINGTON ARMS COMPANY, INC.
P.O. BOX 99

22 RIFLE TRAIL

HICKORY, KY. 42051

Phone: 270-856-4204

Fax: 270-856-3233

E-mail: metty.morgan@remington.com
Visit us @ www.remington.com

>
> From: Brennan, Joh

>To: Morgan, Metty E.
> Subject: RE: P/N F28¢
-

> Metty,

0 700 S8 TRIGGER PIN

uote fro
rcosti

ladin, and they quoted .642ea., and a $380 Engineering charge.
a. If so, then please just add my requirements of 50,000 to
y cost is 50 much higher. | told him to let my 50 piggy back your

aq

> Areyous
> your order.

Subject to Protective Order - Williams v. Remington

ETEQ00004173



> quantity.

?

>

> Metty E. Morgan

> Purchasing

> REMINGTON ARMS COMPANY, INC.
>P.0. BOX 99

> 22 RIFLE TRAIL

> HICKORY, KY. 42051

> Phone: 270-856-4204

> Fax: 270-856-3233

> E-mail: metty. morgan@remington.com
> Visit us @ www.remington.com

-
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-
> From: Brennan, John T.

> Sent: Monday, February 14, 2005 7:15 AM
>To: Morgan, Metty E.

> Co:  Cooke, Steve

> Subject: P/N F202540 700 SS TRIGGER
=

> Metty,
- 3
> | believe you are looking for information on the sulji
$162 per 1000. My yearly projection is 156000 _pi
please let me know.
-

> John

>

> 315 895-3541.

>
>

ﬁrrently purchasing from Palladin at
“want to piggyback on my order

Subject to Protective Order - Williams v. Remington

ETEQ0000414



