JOHN LOSCHIN

From: Kemp, Lisa

Sent: 01/30/2003 10:05:25 AM

To: Atkins, Denise; Loschin, John; Evans, Danny
ce:

BCC:

Subject: FW: Richard Roberts / 700 safety rebates

Flease read Coresco’s response helow on the gentlernen who had 6 guns repaifed:Bot could not supply
invoice of safe purchase. Do you want us to pay anyway? It 5 & little suspicious to me.

Let me know how you want to proceed.
Lisa O. Kemp

Remington Arms Company. Inc.
870 Remington Drive

PO Box 700

Madison, NG 27025
336/548-8523 phone
336/548-7741 fax
Lisa.Kemp@Remington.com

----- Qriginal Messages--
From: Donna Whitley [mailto.dwhitley@core,
Sent: Thursday, January 30, 2003 9:35 AM
To: Kemp, Lisa

Subject: RE: Richard Roberts / 700 safe:

Good Morning Lisa;

| checked in to the situation below a
documenting converstations with M
LIPG for the purchase of the saf
receipt and LJPC. He says he d
modified.

ombination of notes we have in the system
indicate that he did not send in a receipt or
mer service and was explained to that we need a
‘why he was unqualified. He did have () guns

ased a safe?

We will certainly proceed in any uthorize, we just thought you needed to know that we have
no proof of purchase. -

Donna Whitley
Account Bervice Representat

p@remington.com]
& M
00 safety rebates

Please give Bt back. What does "a history” mean?

Lisa O. Kernp

Subject to Protective ms v. Remington

MAE0001682¢



Remington Arms Company, Ine.
870 Remington Drive

PO Box 700

Madison, NC 27025
336/548-8523 phone
336/548-T741 fax

Lisa Kemp@Remington.com

----- Original Message-----

From: Faulgcon, Pamela ..

Sent; Tuesday, January 28, 2003 2:41 PM

To: Kemp, Lisa

Cc: Atkins, Denise

Subject; FW: Richard Roberts / 700 safely rebates

This is O YOUw vvivniveraennn Ponna is on vacation until Thursda
————— Qriginal Message--—-

Fraom: Atking, Denise

Sent: Tuesday, January 28, 2003 2:37 PM
To: Faulcon, Pamela L.

Subject: Richard Roberts / 700 safety rebates
Hi Pam, On November 21, 2002, Mr. Roberts called and intgis
the Model 700 safety modification pragram. He ha
rebate coupons toward the purchase of his safe. P
approvad, He has not receivad his rebale. | calleg
by Sandy that he “had a history” and that the reir
contacting Donna Whilley at the fulfillment Cent.;
someone alse? | wasn't sure if this was one of y

ing his safety rebates from
id wanted to use all six $20
ohn Loschin, this was

ing in Monroe and was informed
Ve 1o be approved by you

of this or do | need to ask

Denise . Atking

Remington Arms Company
Consumer Service
Telelphone: 338-548-8799
Fax: 336-548-7801

denise atkins@remington.corn

Subject to Protective Of ms v. Remington

MAE0001683C



