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Engell, Ronald F. 

From: dwills@smbtrials.com 
Sent: 
To: 

Tuesday, July 30, 2002 10:55 AM 
Engell, Ronald F. · 

Cc: Supry, Fred L. 
Subject: Re: RE: Model 700 AWR --- 300 Rem Ultra Mag --- Claim of Al Poling 

Thanks, Ron. Yes, deliver it to Fred when you get it done ... I will get 
tRe shipping instructions out to Fred once I get the FFL from Mr. 
Paling's lawyer. 

Dale 

>>> "Ron.Engell@remington.com" 07/30 6:26 AM >>> 
two or three weeks at most ...... you wnat me to give this to Fred when 
finished ? 

-----original Message-----
From: dwills@smbtrials.com [mailto:dwills@smbtrials.com) Sent: Monday, 
July 29, 2002 5:56 PM 

·To: Engell, Ronald F. 
Cc: Supry, Fred L. 
Subject: Model 700 AWR --- 300 Rem Ultra Mag Claim of Al Poling 

Ron, 

I have settled a potential lawsuit by Mr. Poling who wants a Model 700 
AWR in 300 Rem Ultra Mag. How long will it take to have this type of 
rifle ready? By the way, for your accounting purposes on this, contact 
Fred Supry and he can give you the Remington file or account number on 
this settlement. 

Thanks, 

Dale 
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