
BARBER· REM DOCSB0016576 

International Customer Service 
Tel: 336-548-8832 
Fax: 336-548-8610 
george.mchugh@remington.com 

-----Original Message-----
From: Istvan Berczi [mailto:berczii@Ms.UManitoba.CA] 
Sent: Wednesday, September 10, 2003 2:58 PM 
To: McHugh, George 
Subject: Re: Istvan Berczi, DVM, PhD. Manitoba.Canada, M700 '·!'!'~!<;:::::::::::::-:-. 
repair. RE00067527 

Dear Mr. McHugh, 
Pleaase charge the following card for all expenses: 
VISA 4514 0936 0050 5651 
Valid 10/06 
Dr. Istvan Berczi ·.·.····.·.·.···••::::.:.:.:::':'::/??::<:X 
I thank. you for all the efforts you put up for this cause. ,:f::::ry::::;::::::::::::::::::: 
Sincerely yours, Istvan Berczi :::::::;;:::<:??\:: .... 
Subject: Istvan Berczi, DVM, PhD. Manitoba,Qanad'if,\!\M'i'#kt:i:f:f~. repair. RE00067527 
Date sent: Tue, 9 Sep 2003 14:19:51 -0400 ··· ................. . 

Priority: Urgent .::::::::::::: ,::::: .... 
From: "McHugh, George" <George.Mcfj:@~'@rery@gton.c(:>p)? 
To: "Istvan Berczi" <berczii@Ms.Uf\ll~~~oba.QAW ······· 

.·:.:.:.:.:.:·· 
>Dear Dr. Berczi, ··•::')?/?/:?.. ./?t 
> Please send me the information again by email,"i:fr'ti:N\WJ~::-::/?/ 
> 336-548-8610. I cannot find the fax you ha.y~,J~f.~rred ti'.J':' .,.,.,., .•• ,.,.,., .. 
> 
>George A. McHugh ::::~:~:~:~:~:::~:~:~:~:~:~:: :: :: ·. 

> Remington Arms Co., Inc. 
> International Customer Service 
>Tel: 336-548-8832 
> Fax: 336-548-8610 
> george.mchugh@remington.com _::::,:,., 
> 
> 
> ./::: .. ,,,,,,:x:::J:::,. 
>-----Original Message----- :\if ::-... ·· \)/ 

·.:.:-:.:.:.:.:· 

> From: Istvan Berczi [mailto:~Ni.ii@MMJManitoba.CA] 

~ ~~:n~~~~~~~~;0~~~mbe_~:~r:~,~~~:j[~~ PM 

··.:.:-:.:.· 

>Subject: Re: Istvan BerczCDVMXP.hdLManitoba,Canada, M700 rifle 
> repair. RE00067527 · ··· ···:::::ii:::::: .• 
> 
> <::::::<\~Ut~I~t\:::::::::.:·. · ·-:.:··· 
> Dear Mr. McHugh, '''''tIX:t:::;,,,,._ 
> I did Fax the authori:;:;~VRf:UP:r:m:t9:WM:@fit week. and gave my 
>credit card numbe@ji:i:fui{ki:ilsif:maffed"f.he original form to your 
>company at the safu~mm~~:J'lease charge the entire cost of the repair 
> plus handling costs fo'Wi\i{~~\l::qird. I hope that this will be 
>satisfactory. Sincernly youfo';''i~f®ffl:lerczi. Subject: Istvan 
> Berczi, DVM,P;l:\QH~~iji~Q\;l;:i,Ca·naiia: M700 rifle repair. RE00067527 Date 
>sent: {:M\ii'ii!8'S¢~f~\:g:p 13:10:39-0400 From: "McHugh, 
>George" <G#ii'Qe.McHug'l"i@:ffti:nington.com> To: "Istvan Berczi" 
> <berczii@~~J_JManitoba.CA@(. 
> ·:<<·>>>:·. :.:-:.:.:.:.: 
> > Dear or. ~m~~~... ../:}:::::·· 
> > I contad®.j:~~:r:Ji!iAAl.M:S.:C11ity on Ilion, NY. They informed me 
> > th_1:1:tth.!:!Y did:i'l@:~~ive the$ 20.00 fee for the inspection 

:.:-:.:.:.:.:· ···.·.·.·· 

··:.:.:-:.:.:.:.:.:-:.:.:.:·.·.· .. ·.:.:.:-:.:.:.:·· 
Subject to Protective Oi'.{;!~fff:wfi!lfams v. Remington 
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