JOHN LOSCHIN

From: Chilton, Inez

Sent: 09/17/2002 12:56:15 PM

To: Loschin, John

L

BCC:

Subject: FW: Istvan Bevezi, DVM, PhD. Manitoba,Ca fle repair. REODO67527

Nicole sent this to George on 08/06/03. Me stanted he reques dthie import info-atithat time.

Thank you :-}

Inez W. Chilton

Senior Consumer Service Rep
Remington Arms Company
P.O. Box 700

Madison, NC 27025

FPhone: 800-243-9700

Fax. 336-548-7801

Visit us at rernington.com

----- Qriginal Message--—-
From: McHugh, George

Sent: Wednesday, September 17, 2003 12
To: Chilton, Inez . )

Subject: FW: Istvan Berczi, DVM, PhD. I; M 700 rifle repair. REQDOB7527
Inez,
FYl...

George A. McHugh
Remington Arms Co., Inc.
Inernational Customer Service
Tel: 336-548-8832

Fax: 336-548-8610
george.mehugh@reminglon.c

From: Istvan Berczi [maif
Sent: Monday, Septembel
To: McHugh, George 3
Subject: Re: Istvan Berges ifitoba,Canada, M700 rifle
repair. REQOOBTEZ

Deaar Mr. McHug
ard nimber and faxed it to another
: Bd by the shop, you said.

‘Berczi. .

stvan Berczi, £

Subject: , PhD. Manitoba,Canada, M700 rifle repair. RECOOE7S27

Date sent: e, 95ep 2 *19:51 -Q400
Priority:
From: rge" «George McHugh@remington.com:

Subject to Protective ms v. Remington

MAE0001650C



To: "[stvan Berozi" <berczii@Ms.UManitoba CA>

> Dear Dr. Berezi,
> Please send me the information again by email, or to my fax
> 336-548-8610. | cannot find the fax you have referred to.
=

> George A, McHugh

= Remington Arms Co., Ing,

> International Customer Service

> Tel: 336-548-8832

> Fax; 336-548-8610

> george.mchugh@remington.com

~~~~~ CQriginal Message-----
> From Istvan Berczi [mailto:berczii@Ms.UManitoba, CA)
> Gent; Tuesday, September 09, 2003 4:.09 PM
> To: McHugh, George
» Subject: Re: Istvan Berczi, DVM, Phd. Manitoba, Canada, M700:rifls
> repair. REQQQG7527
g

b2

> Dear Mr. MckHugh,
> | did Fax the authonizalion form to you last week;
> cradit card number there. | also mailed the origigal:
> company at the same time. Please charge th
> plus handling costs to my credit cand. | hope
> satisfactory. Sincarely yours, 1stvan Barczi, Sulje
= Berczi, DVM, Phd. Manitaba,Canada, M700 rifle i
> sent: Mon, 8 Sep 2003 13:10:39 -0400.From:
> Georye” <George. MecHugh@uremington.
» «berczii@Ms.UManitoba. CA>

>
> = Dear Dr. Berzad, :

E | contacted our repairfacility o \ infdiined me
B that they did not receive the $ 2 .U : pithe | ction

> and service performed on yg
> > If not please send it to;
> = REMINGTON ARMS CQ. INC,
> PO, BOX 700

> > MADISON, NC 27025
== USA

-

> = Please note your repai
> & GOMTESPONGence you en

> = will pay $ 20..00 , youwi

your check and any
gmber i is RE0006752? Although you

d and inspected and the bolt lock
$20.00 plus shipping and handling. We

> > hearing
> > safes.)"
gl

== The rifle
> » "Gene's

¢l back to you. | have spoken with
. | have asked him to obtain the

Subject to Protective ms v. Remington

MAE00016501



= an export license. You may want to speak with Gene Gunning the owner
== of "Gene's.." | would recommend that, in the future, you should

> = conlact Gene's gunsmithing for any repairs hefore shipping your

> firearm out of your country. Gene could have perfaormed all the same
> » service required without the difficulties and delays caused by the

> = import-export process,

»on

> = George A, McHugh

> » Remington Arms Co., In:.

> > |nternational Customer Service

> > Tel, 336-548-8832

> > Fax; 336-548-8610

> » george.mchugh@remingion.com

-

> >

-

B eem Criginal Message-ww-

= > From: Istvan Berozi [mailto berczii@Ms. UManitoba.CA]
> » Sent; Friday. September 05, 2003 8:14 PM
= » To: McHugh, George .
== Subject: Re: Istvan Berczi, DVM, Phd. Manitoba,C
> repair. REQQOST7527

o

R

= > Dear Mr MeHugh,

> » The olher day | sent you the authorization fo
> »ogun.
> x> However, you Lold me that you actually have
== mmust say thet you pesued this matter with
= » appreciate your efforts. If you don't mind | wou
= » where do we stand now with this and tha
= rifle. | appreciate your advice of dealin
= = Selkirk, however, | tried to contact hirg
= = weeks and never succeeded, Becau
= » gffort to go there and to find cut wi
= = the gun to you. Also, | trusl you m
> = with this SEI‘ISIIIVEJOD | do not see t
== this is my rifle, it is registred in g fame,
> > take it accross the border if U

> > we cannct even clame the 1
| laok

= = forwards Lo hear from you
= > Subject: 3
> » rifle repair. REQOD6752
L Wed, 6 Aug 2003 13"
> > <George. McHugh@remi

, Phd. Manilcha,Canada, M700

"McHugh, George"

] <berczil@Ms.lU i FeAili@Ms . UManitoba . CA> Copies Lo.
> “Smith-Wood, Ni¢ Wood@remington.com:

> > i

>3

> > > Dear Dr. Berc

> arm has been repaired.

> aly, we cannot ship it

-k

E S the'tE's A requires an

e S gense on our end. | have

Y our warranty repair gunsmith
> wince: GENE'S GUNSMITHING in
A 204-757-4413)

PR R ith Gene Gunning, the

PR :

P as agreed to secure the

Subject to Protective ms v. Remington
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> = George A, McHugh

= = > Remington Arms Co. Inc.

== International Customer Service
== Tel 336-548-8832

> Fax 336-548-86810

= = = george.mehugh@remington.com

PR
P
Te o

> » » Thig email has been scanned for viruses B
B yirNS SCANNST.

oo
e
o
o
o

s = This email has been scanned for vie
> ® virus scanner.

>
g
>
-
-
-

> This email has been scanne

= gcanner.,
>
-
>

> This email has been s

= scanner.
-

This email has been scan

Subject to Protective Of

necessary Canadian documents that will
allow me to apply for an Export license
in the U.5 A If you ever have a
problem or need a repair, | recommend
that you contact him first, before
sending your firearm outside of Canada.
| tried to reach you at your home
telephone and spoke with a very nice
lady who only speaks Hungarian.
Unfortunately, | cannot converse in this
language and was unable to leave a
meassage. | tried your office telephone
204-789-3996. | spoke with a lady at a
medical facility who assured me thal yo
are unknown there, Please contaclt me ¢
when (if} you receive my email to
discuss vour rille repair,

ms v. Remington

v McAfée VWebshield €500 virus

WicAfee Webshield €500 virus

by McAfee Webshield e500 virus scanner.

MAEQ00016503



