
Norma Osteen 

From: 
Sent: 
To: 
CC: 
BCC: 
Subject: 

Kemp, Lisa 
07/09/2002 01 :31 :51 PM 
O'Steen, Norma; Evans, Danny 

RE: Rebate 

I don't know what the tax is but if he paid $52 that is what Co1,esto6 
Ceresco will send whatever you tell them to send. His case 

Lisa Kemp 
Ren1ington Arms Co., Inc. 
870 Remington Drive 
PO Sox 700 
Madison, NC 27025 
(336)548-8523 
(336)548-77 41 fax 
lisa.kemp@remington.com 
-----Original Message----­
From: O'Steen, Norma 
Sent: Tuesday, July 09, 2002 12:17 PM 
To: Kemp, Lisa: Evans, Danny 
Subject: RE: Rebate 

Lisa, 

Mr, Roux said he submitted coupons 
submitted coupons for $60 then why ,:n:nn:<.c1insider 

Norma Wray O'Steen 
Senior Consumer Service Reoreser 
Remington AnTis Company, Inc. 
P,O, Box 700 
Madison, NC 27025-0700 
Phone: 336-548-8787 
Fax: 336-548-7801 
norma.osteen@remington.cqff:f:·:·.. . ..... . 
Visit Remington Country@ ~\rMJ!rjtton,com 

~~~~~Original Ml1e1~~a,1e----- ) \: 
From: Kemp, Lisa 
Sent: Tuesday, July 09, 
To: O'Steen, Norma; Evans, 
Subject: RE: Rebate}(?@)/'••·,···,· / ) 

Norma, 

$52,00 (23,95 X 2 +tax). If he 
reimbursement? 

Donna at Core~P::B::~i~~!il~£1~.~, and here is what we found. He submitted 3 rebates like he said 
but he only p~!'¢~~~ed 2 ~~~mWf!s at 23,95 a piece. Coresco paid him $20 for the first rebate and denied 
the rest Wh!\!Jhave told the!ij~ do is to process the 2nd rebate for $20, He will need to supply an 
additional re~~~~r receipt and ·~@::code to receive the remaining $20. Please call and let him know that. 

Danny, 

Subject to Protective v, Remington 

MAE00017065 



Lisa Kemp 
Remington Arms Co.,lnc. 
870 Remington Drive 
PO Box 700 
Madison, NC 27025 
(336)548-8523 
(336)548-7741 fax 
lisa.kemp@remington.com 
~~~~~Original Message~~-~~ 

From: O'Steen, Norma 
Sent: Tuesday, July 09, 2002 8:55 AM 
To: Kemp, Lisa 
Subject: Rebate 

Lisa: 

This is the information for the gentleman who sent in tt1j~'~··~~~!~~~:@M•~~-•£m Program rebate: 

Dennis Roux 
2618 Noble Ave. 
Bakersfield, CA 93306 
661-399-2083 

Norma Wray O'Steen 
Senior Consumer Service Representative 
Remington Arms Company, Inc. 
P.O. Box 700 
Madison, NC 27025-0700 
Phone: 336-548-8787 
Fax: 336-548-7801 
norma.osteen@remington.com 
Visit Remington Country@ _w_rem1fl 

Subject to Protective v. Remington 

Modification 

MAE00017066 


